
BID PROPOSALS 
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION SERVICE
8/24/2011

              AWARD OF CONTRACT   CHARGE OF SERVICES
Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Option 5 Option 6  Option #3 Option #5 TO RESIDENTS

  under opt #2
M & S Waste Servies
1/01/2012 - 12/21/2012 303,390 280,400 293,000 NO BID NO BID $270.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID
1/01/2013 - 12/31/2013 312,390 289,850 302,900 NO BID NO BID $270.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID
1/01/2014 - 12/31/2014 323,740 298,414 311,900 NO BID NO BID $270.00 $160.00 NO BID NO BID

Future Sanitaton
1/01/2012 - 12/21/2012 381,000 276,600 339,000 276,600 229,900 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $180.00
1/01/2013 - 12/31/2013 383,000 278,600 342,000 278,600 231,500 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $180.00
1/01/2014 - 12/31/2014 385,000 278,600 344,000 278,600 235,000 $225.00 $225.00 $225.00 $180.00

DeLisa Demolition
1/01/2012 - 12/21/2012 NO BID 277,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $280.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/01/2013 - 12/31/2013 NO BID 277,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $280.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/01/2014 - 12/31/2014 NO BID 277,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $280.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Waste Management of NJ
1/01/2012 - 12/21/2012 465,744 372,600 424,992 372,600 336,600 $120.00 $70.00 $120.00 $70.00
1/01/2013 - 12/31/2013 475,056 380,052 430,992 380,052 343,332 $120.00 $70.00 $120.00 $70.00
1/01/2014 - 12/31/2014 484,548 389,052 436,992 389,052 350,196 $120.00 $70.00 $120.00 $70.00
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